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 Submitted via email to techforum@bpa.gov on June 2, 2021 

RE: Comments in Response to May 19 BPA EIM Stakeholder Meeting 

PPC appreciates the opportunity to comment on BPA’s Energy Imbalance Market (EIM) 
stakeholder process.  These “implementation” workshops are an important part of BPA’s five-
phase process in place to guide the agency’s decision on EIM participation.    

All PPC members are statutory preference customers of BPA and represent over 90 percent of 
BPA’s Tier 1 sales.  Overall, Northwest public power is the largest purchaser of BPA’s power 
products and services and is among the largest purchasers of BPA’s transmission products and 
services, funding nearly 70 percent of the agency’s total power and transmission costs.  As BPA 
is a self-funding agency and covers its costs by selling its products and services, this means that 
PPC members will bear the majority of the impacts from BPA’s participation in the EIM.  As a 
representative for those that will bear the majority of the risk associated with EIM participation, 
we repeat our request that BPA perform a genuine and thorough analysis of participation in 
making this decision. 

PPC reiterates the importance of Phase V of BPA’s EIM decision process.  The comments 
offered below are limited to responding to BPA’s materials presented on May 19.  PPC is not 
taking a position on BPA’s EIM participation at this time.  In that spirit, PPC offers the initial 
comments on the concepts presented at BPA’s May 19 BPA EIM stakeholder meeting. 

EIM Business Practice 

PPC appreciates BPA’s overview of its planned approach for updating its business practices to 
enable EIM participation.  To fully understand the impact of BPA’s participation in the EIM on 
the agency’s business practices, we would appreciate a list of which existing business practices 
will be updated as part of BPA’s participation and a description of any new business practices 
that will be created.  It would be particularly helpful if this list could refer back to the topics 
included in the customer impact overview so customers could crosswalk where each of those 
impacts will be codified. 

BPA should also publish its EIM business practice, even if it is still in draft form, at the same 
time it issues its Phase V letter to the region to help inform customer comment on the agency’s 
participation.  The purpose of having the Phase V decision after implementation scoping and 
after the rates and tariff proceedings is so that customers can comment on BPA’s potential EIM 
participation with full knowledge of how that participation will be implemented.  Understanding 
what will be captured in the EIM business practice, even if it is not fully finalized, will be helpful 
in informing customers’ positions. 
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Post Go-Live Reporting 

While we appreciated BPA verbally acknowledging some of our recommendations for post go-
live reporting submitted in advance of the workshop, it was unfortunate that BPA did not 
respond in writing.  We ask that BPA do so in the June workshop.  In response to the proposal 
for go-live reporting presented at the May 19 workshop, we reiterate the requests for reporting 
included in our May 11 comments. 

Consistent with our earlier comments, the metrics to track performance of policies established in 
BP-22 and TC-22 rate cases should be included in regular reporting.  We do not agree waiting 
until pre-rate and tariff workshops to begin reviewing available data is the best approach to 
understanding the impacts of rates and tariff rules adopted in BP-22 and TC-22.  These metrics 
should be included as part of regular, qualitative and quantitative reporting on the agency’s EIM 
participation post go-live. 

BPA should not solely rely on the CAISO benefit report to assess benefits of EIM participation.  
The simplified approach taken to generate this benefit report is likely not reflective of the actual 
benefits that BPA will accrue though EIM participation.  If BPA does believe this is an accurate 
representation of benefits received, it should work with customers to describe why that is the 
case and explain how these benefits will flow through to Power Services customers, specifically 
how they would be captured in future modeling in BPA rate cases.  If the agency has confidence 
in these benefit estimates, PPC will expect to see a consistent estimate of benefits reflected in 
future rates.  If the agency does not have enough confidence in those estimates to reflect the 
estimated benefits received in its future rates, a new approach for estimating benefits must be 
developed. 

BPA should perform its own benefit analysis on EIM participation to better understand not only 
the level of benefits received, but also what types of benefits it is realizing through EIM 
participation.  BPA should work with customers to develop a methodology to better assess 
benefits realized through EIM participation.  This methodology should work to identify benefits 
associated with meeting imbalance needs within the BAA and separately identify benefits to 
secondary revenues through a more efficient dispatch of the FCRPS beyond balancing needs.  
Understanding these details will be important to help customers understand whether BPA’s 
participation is the EIM is consistent with BPA’s EIM participation principles – particularly #5, 
“Bonneville’s participation is consistent with the objectives of Bonneville’s strategic plan.” 

Additionally, the agency should make data related to BPA’s participation available to customers 
once it goes live in the EIM so customers can perform their own analysis.  We look forward to 
discussing with BPA in more detail the mechanism for making this information available as well 
as what information would be helpful for customers. 

Phase V Close Out Letter 

PPC is supportive of the items that BPA plans to include in its Phase V close out letter but must 
also address the issues PPC is raising here.  In particular we agree that thorough assessment of 
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the changes between the Phase V decision and BPA’s previous EIM Policy Record of Decision 
will be important. 

PPC recommends that BPA also clearly capture any elements of EIM market design or 
governance that the agency sees as required for supporting BPA’s participation.  For instance, in 
early phases of the stakeholder process, BPA identified changes to CAISO’s Local Market 
Power Mitigation (LMPM) policies to be a “must have” for participation.  Are there other areas 
BPA has identified as critical for supporting participation?  This list should not be limited to 
areas where changes are needed for BPA to participate, as was the case with LMPM, but also 
areas where potential revisions away from current policy may impact BPA’s ability to 
participate.  We understand that the agency cannot imagine all potential rule revisions which 
may cause it to rethink its EIM participation, but it would be helpful if BPA identified 
foundational aspects of the market design that are essential to enabling the agency’s potential 
participation. 

In addition to those topics identified for inclusion in the Phase V close out letter, BPA should 
also make clear commitments to regularly report on EIM participation metrics, including any 
commitments on developing and improving methodology for assessing costs and benefits 
associated with participation. 

Business Case 

PPC appreciates BPA sharing its assessment of the business case early, given the extremely tight 
Phase V process.  We are disappointed that it appears that BPA will not address questions raised 
by PPC and others around the existing business case results, BPA’s confidence in those results, 
and BPA’s assessment of whether similar levels of benefits will ever actually be reflected in 
Power Service’s rates. 

It is challenging to comment on whether there are sufficient benefits resulting from BPA’s EIM 
participation when BPA does not appear to believe that actual or reasonable benefits expected to 
accrue to customers are reflected in the business case.  BPA’s rate case testimony, as well as the 
framing provided for other analysis based off of the E3 analysis, made it clear that BPA has little 
confidence that the agency will experience the level of benefits shown in the E3 study in the near 
term and possibly ever.   

Further, to the extent that net benefits may materialize there is currently no clear plan to quantify 
those benefits or include that value in rates.  As PPC has made clear in many instances, 
additional and systematic accrual of financial reserves is not a net benefit to power customers 
due to the opportunity cost of lost alternative uses of those funds.  Like any business, BPA has 
liquidity needs which are governed by the Treasury Payment Probability standard and Financial 
Reserves Policy.  However, financial reserves for risk in the BPA fund accrue almost zero 
interest.  Those funds could be put to higher value uses by public power utilities and the 
communities and businesses they serve.  Rates should be set at the lowest level consistent with 
sound business principles and not to accrue cash reserves beyond the liquidity needs of the 
business.   
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Our understanding is that BPA sees the E3 study as the “industry standard” for assessing benefits 
but does not have enough confidence in this industry standard analysis to use it to develop an 
estimated impact of EIM participation in BPA’s Power Rates.  It continues to be unclear to PPC 
why the E3 study is sufficient to make a business decision, but insufficient to use as a starting 
point for capturing changes to secondary revenues in rates.  In addition to raising important 
questions about the consistent use of the E3 study, PPC’s testimony on this issue recommended 
use of some of the scenarios run as part of the E3 study in BPA’s rate calculation, with 
appropriate modifications to reflect the timing and effectiveness of BPA’s anticipated 
participation in the EIM during the BP-22 time period.  Agency staff rejected this 
recommendation.  The excerpt of PPC’s BP-22 testimony addressing BPA’s EIM benefit 
estimates is attached for reference. 

In its Phase V letter to the region, BPA should clearly explain if and when BPA actually expects 
to receive benefits at levels reflected in the E3 study.  If the agency does not expect to receive 
this level of benefits, it should explain why the study is sufficient for supporting BPA’s 
participation in the EIM. 

Appropriate Quantification and Distribution of EIM Benefits to Preference Customers  

The disconnect described above between assessed benefits in the business case and expected 
benefits included in rates creates significant uncertainty in whether Power customers will ever 
realize the anticipated benefit of EIM participation.  This potential is even more concerning 
given BPA’s proposal to track benefits going forward is the CAISO benefit report.  This is 
another “industry standard” report, which may or may not earn BPA’s confidence, and PPC is 
concerned that it will provide another excuse for the agency to base its participation in the EIM 
on one set of analysis, while using another – entirely different – analysis to determine what 
benefits power customers actually receive. 

We are concerned that the result could be BPA continuing to purport significant benefits in the 
EIM, without actually having the confidence to include those benefits in the lowering of Power 
service rates.  We look forward to hearing how the agency plans to address these concerns in its 
Phase V letter to the region.  

Conclusion 

PPC appreciates the opportunity to comment.  We would like to express our appreciation for 
staff’s hard work to develop and share BPA’s planned EIM policies with stakeholders through 
this process. 



Q: Please briefly summarize your analysis and recommendations regarding this issue. 

Q: What is the Energy Imbalance Market? 



Q: How does BPA staff propose to account for the BP-22 Power benefits that could be 

realized if BPA joins the EIM? 

Q: Has BPA previously studied the potential benefits that could be realized if BPA joins the 

EIM? 

Bonneville Power Admin



See

see also

Q: What were the results of the E3 cost-benefit analysis? 

Q: Has BPA previously relied upon the results of the E3 benefits analysis? 

annual



Q: How does BPA staff justify its EIM Secondary Credit forecast deviating so substantially 

from the E3 study? 



Q: Does PPC agree with BPA staff’s assessment? 

Q: Please explain how BPA’s proposal inequitably caps BPA customer benefits without 

limiting customers’ risk exposure? 



Q: Please explain how the E3 study already developed scenarios that can be used for a 

shallow entry. 

Q: What is the significance of limiting participation to the amount required to pass the 

flexible ramping sufficiency test? 



Q: Please explain the operational constraints included in the E3 Benefit Analysis. 



Q: Please explain PPC’s concern with BPA staff’s assessment that if BPA staff had 

developed a risk-adjusted version of the E3 study, it would have likely resulted in a 

benefit close to the $3.4 million. 

See



Q: What is PPC’s proposal? 

Q: Should BPA decide to not join the EIM, or if realized benefits fall below the $11.7 million 

per year, will the Power business line be materially harmed? 



Q: Does PPC have any other recommendations? 



Q: What are your recommendations on this topic? 

Q: Does this conclude your testimony? 


	PPC Comments 05-2021 EIM Meeting.pdf
	PPC EIM Benefits Testimony BP-22

